
 

 

Scattergood-Olympic Cable A 
Transmission Line 

ladwp.com/Scattergood-Olympic 

Project 
Schedule 
Summer 2017 – 
Summer 2018 

Region 
West Los 
Angeles 

Project Description 
The Scattergood-Olympic 
Cable A Transmission Line is 
an 11.4 mile underground 
transmission line that will 

Required to comply with 
federally mandated power 
reliability standards, the project 
will improve system flexibility 
and efficiency to better utilize 
power generation resources 
including the Scattergood 
Generating Station. 
 

Construction 
Information 
Construction on this portion of 
the Scattergood-Olympic 
transmission line includes 
excavation along portions of 
Lincoln Blvd in the Playa Vista 
area to install and splice cable.  
Traffic and parking will be 
partially impacted along the 
project route. Temporary No 
Parking/Tow Away signs will be 
posted as needed. Construction 
work is scheduled from 7 a.m. 
to 7 p.m., Monday through 
Saturday, with occasional night 
work in some sections. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

reinforce existing power 
infrastructure to enhance power 
system reliability for western 
Los Angeles. Routine testing 
has shown that the existing 
transmission line, which first 
entered commercial service in 
1974, needs to be 
supplemented to avoid power 
outages in the area.  
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